&A™
HHEN) 9 9 R
g9dIy ®a= : Wo Ao sho A7t E fieehi—2

AT T@FE—11 /14 /1 /2002—300 ¢4 fdo fasi®: 05—04—2011

a1 9,
2|

(Fewg e e 91 )
fRTa— At 5w 991 (@507) g, 1950 § woE |

HBIey,

feergaR gfaa 5 oar 2 f6 9RT WReR, s R ISR HITEE @
JfeRgET =T (38012 /03 /201010 Fo—1 fiis 23 #Ad, 2011 S fb wRa &7
GYA AR -2, WUS 3 & IU—vs (i) §TAT 220(31), A 23, 2011 ¥ UHIIT &
2, @ NI HHAN oG 991 (@) 7w, 1950 § e fBar mar 2

JrfergEeT @ wfer gEemt 9fg 7
Hag

r
o ggaR | (T=0 o )/
Sy-fRe® (@o & fo)

gfaferd: Sued sfrga o ufa afdd gamn Ud amavas sRars =g uftd B—

1. ot & s/ |ga s (Twr) l

2 ATy Frferd |41 ARBRT /2y |
\/ Tgaa Fewe (i), e @ IR 2 & 39 13 d daip sfergaan

HT J9E1EC H IUArS BN |
Her: AR |

P

(T=0 Bo )/

Sy-—frw® (o e fa)




TS | 2le Ao 33004/99 _ t REGD.NO.D. L.-33004/99

The Gazette of India

P EXTRAORDINARY

ﬂ‘m TR (M )\\ W [ QUT 3—IT-WUE (i)
p aV v, _,/.)u w_3v PART Ii—Section 3—Sub-section (i)
o oqet T e wfadR | e

SN B PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
ol 9 150 ¢ faeeht, quan, ur 23, 201197 2, 1933
No. 150] B NEW DELHI, WEDNESDAY, MARCH 23, 2011/CHAITRA 2, 1933

5w 3t e WA
ferger
¢ feeett, 23 wid, 2011

WA 229( 31 ) —FrEr T S (F39) Fm, 1950 ¥ o geiva w0 @ wfawa gdie fam wder
T SUfTE, 1948 (1948 &1 34) 1 ¥R 95 &1 I9-MRT (1) B 314 quramifad, wRd G@R, 59 3R ISR 569 Fi
shyge wem T 223, i 29 Famy, 2010 3R 9Ra % TR f i 4 femmr, 2010 ®, 57 oYt st @ Tt

9 YA 9 F GHEA @ R % U193 1 wiar S g it w1 R, o #) SUeres S0 i aiE

7 30 27 #1 safy F G| a@ et R gge ot w6 % fag yefva feg 1w 9 )
AN Fafer I TTF HY QG S i 4 FT@=w, 2010 F1 Iyesy w5 § S of;
qur Fafw @ ey ¥ fedt safa @ w1 anofa = e wa T gen €
A, 39, FHAR) T 91 AfufEm, 1948 F T 95 g TR Wil H1 TEN wE K DT WHR, FHAR
T A fm &y faan-faue F6 % e FHEM g 9 (FE) fmm, 1950 ° R de w6 @ fae g
fao gerdt 2, Ama: —
(1) 3 Tram et = 9 () (Fmye) faw, 2011 w8 S
(2) 3 3, 2011 & Yoot 3 @ &g B |
2 FHE 59 W (F=) faw, 1950 § 3as 9% gyA e % v A a<iiE, fEm ss |, su-fem (1) 9§,
Queg (h) H—
(1) 39-@WUE (@) H, " 13Re a8 vk &, ey ad " vl | wioeenfug faan smom |
(2) IW-@UE () H,—
(%) “3r3RE 94 & 3g e ya faaw e oF, I ft e 21" wssl o g S |
(@) T wgE |, Fefafen v &t wfoeenfia fEn s, ama: —
‘g7 T S S g % WOY SEE e W quian anfun e 2y stuE <o O @ o
A anfyrs fedens stepa @A oF I fwan s w17
3. wue framl ), fram 59 o, “ore e " vl & <9 TR TR vl § wiaenfia e smem o
4. wumA frdt |, fram 61 9 —
(1) mfws wve F, " srfuafia 1 o1y @ @ W v A, “ aAfaffa w5 g @ +0 W, @1 QAiow
Tafgfa dem & sfavia Garfiad B o a1 wead Sarfigha ok e vl @ wfaeenfa fran smom;

1949 GL2011 (nH



2 i THE GAZETTE OF INDIA: EXTRAORDINARY [ParT II—Skc. 3(i)]

(2) w=(1) ¥, 3w sfafia 2 wea” 7= ® 0E W ¢ svE Wises Qafehy dem & st afefe
1@ S ot Aen B, §eagd Hartgha” vl w6l ofq: wenfua fwar s |
5.9 Frael &, Frm 61 % 9% Freafatea Fram sia et fean smom, Jm: —
“61% Tafwem feaemy =) & fog enfum wwan-faa &1 s9-wim-fafesa feaems +t v & forg snfsm
Hrar-faen = @ &l @ o fufaa &Y a2 & |us (1) %m—@v@ (v) a%awfawﬁmwﬁ
yigae | fuw T 7 1"

[@. & m—380|2/3/2010—m‘§.—1 ]

fa AR, 3w wiew

e : yur from, sfegE deam wufen 212, fKAiw 22 5[, 1950 5N WA B T9GT S A 11, @8 3, I9-E0E (i) °
waife forg g o qen sfugEn g w224, faiw 4 ey, 2010 g frsen devE fem @

MINISTRY OF LABOUR AND EMPLOYME#IT
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 23rd March, 2011 :

G.S.R. 229(E).—Whereas certain draft rules further to amend the Employees’ State Insurance (Central) Rules,
1950, were published as required under sub-section (1) of Section 95 of the Employees’ State Insurance Act, 1948 (34 of
1948), vide notification of the Government of India in the Ministry of Labour and Employment, number G.S.R. 223, dated the
29th November, 2010, in the Gazette of India, dated the 4th December, 2010, inviting objections and suggestions from all
persons likely to be affected thereby till the expiry of the period of thirty days from the date on which the copies of the
Gazette of India in which the said notification was published, were made available to the public;

And whereas, the copies of the said Gazette were made available to the public on 4th December, 2010;

And whereas no objection or suggestion has been received from any person in this regard;

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by Section 95 of the Employees’ State Insurance Act, 1948, the
Central Government, after consultation with the Employees’ State Insurance Corporation, hereby makes the followmg
rules further to amend the Employees’ State Insurance (Central) Rules, 1950, namely :—

1.(1) These Rules may be called the Employees’ State Insurance (Central) (Amendment) Rules, 201 1.

(2) They shall come into force with effect from the 1st day of April, 2011.

2. Inthe Employees’ State Insurance (Central) Rules, 1950 (hereinafter referred to as the principal rules), inrule 58,
in sub-rule (1), in clause (A),—

() in sub-clause (b), for the words “eighteen years”, the words “twenty-five years” shall be substituted;

(i) in sub-clause (c),— ¢
(A) the words “until she attains the age of eighteen years or until marriage, whichever is earlier” shall be

omitted;
(B) for the first proviso, the following proviso shall be substltuted, namely :—
“Provided that in the case of legitimate or adopted daughter who is inform and is wholly dependant on
the earnings of the insured person at the time of his death, dependants’ benefit shall continue to be
paid while the infirmity lasts.”.
3. In the principal rules, in rule 59, for the words “five thousand rupees”, the words “ten thousand rupees” shall
be substituted.
4. Inthe principal rules, inrule 61,—

(@) in the opening portion, for the words “on attaining the age of superannuation”, the words “on attaining
the age of superannuation, or retires under a Voluntary Retirement Scheme or takes premature retirement”
shall be substituted;

(i) in term (i), after the words “proof of his superannuation”, the words “or retirement under a Voluntary
Retirement Scheme or as the case may be, premature retirement,” shall be inserted.

5. In the principal rules, after rule 61, the following rule shall be inserted, namely :—
“61A. Income limit of dependent parents for eligibility to medical benefit.—The income of dependent parents
for eligibility to medical benefit under sub-clause (v) of clause (11) of Section 2 of the Act from all sources
should not exceed five thousand rupees in a month.”. )
{F.No. S-38012/3/2010-SS-1]
RAVIMATHUR, Addl. Secy.
Note : The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i), vide notification
number S.R,O. 212, dated the 22nd June, 1950 and last amended vide notification No. G.S.R. 224, dated
4th December, 2010.

Printed by the Manager Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Dethi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Dethi-110054.




