
-
•

•
j'I!IQ I('I ~

Cf)4:qloft ~ fprr ~
~ 1lCR : ~o arrio \ifto lIT1f: 3t ~-2

~: ~-11/14/1/2002-mo ~ fcto ~: 05-04-2011

~-,f
~-----------------

~ ~ ~II jf11 'I! ~ fcl>m \Jl'Tffi t fcn 1ffiCf ~, ~ 3ffi \(~,jPII 'I! 11;::liC"I~ qft

~ ~ ~-38012/03/2010-~0 ~0-1 ~ 23 ~, 2011 \ill" fcn 1ffiCf 'PT

~ ~ 1WT-2, ~ 3 et \1ll-~ (i) ~ 229 (3l), ~ 23, 2011 -,f ~Cf>I~1d st
t et Gm Cf>4:q1~1~ ~ (ctRfm) ~, 1950 -,f ~ fcl>mTJ<ITt 1

~qft~~~tl

~ effm ~~~ICf> / ~ Pi~~ICf> (~) ------- 1

2. j{"Gl/I<'1~ Cf>1£li&1£1et ~ ~/~ --------1o ~Pt~~ICf> (~), j{"~I&1~ xl ~ t fcn ~ ~ cr.m
cm ~6jf1I~c -,f ~ ctR 1

~: 4'dIqRI

1.



~ l:j, S1c n:c'lo 33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004199

~~

OFIT
[:he (!;a~etteof ~ndia

~ftl~HOI .
EXlRAORDlNARY

'IfT1T 1I-~ ~-~ (i)
PART II--Section 3--Sub-section (i)

YlfbCflH ~ YCfll~li1

PUBLISHED BY AUllIORlTY

~~, ~, ltl"'d 23, 2011"'" 2, 1933

NEW DELHI., WEDNESDAY, MARCH 23, 2011/CHAITRA 2, 1933
---- - ._-"

J)llf 3frr ~ ~
~

~ Rffit, 23l1T"f, 2011

m.~.f.f.229(3l).-~~<ftm (~)~, 1950'#3fu:-mlt"R~~~_~~~
r.iP:n Jlf~-lf.:r:rq, 1948 (1948 q:;J 34) q,l ~ 95 <lit~-~ (I) ~ 3l~ -q~3NfIl;{G, 'qffif mq;n, .IJitl 3fu: ~ ~ <fl1

31f~~ ~ -m.q:;J.R. 223, ~ 29 ~, 2010 i;ro 'q'ffif ~ ~ ~ 4 ~, 201O:q, ~ ~ ~ ~ ~
~ '9~ iR q,l ti~ t \IT{(f ~ ~ <lit~ t;rn-q ~ ~ ~ <lit~~, ~ q;l ~ ~ qft mtm
n .10 P." q,l 3TCff~ q,l ~ (fq;' ~ afu: mtm ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ I

3fu: ~~ ~ q,l ~~ q;l4~, 2010 q;l~ ~~ ~ I!ft':
[j~ '~ ~ ~~ .q f<R:iT 0l!fcRf ~ ~ ~ ?;ff~ ~ m ~3l'T t I

sre., 3l"l, ~ ~ <ftm 31f~, 1948 <lit tmT 95 1;RT ~ ~ q:;J m q;-ffl ~ ~ m<liR, ~

'U?l-.n1TIRTTl1~m~~-~~~~~~<ftm (~)~, 1950.q 3fu:-m~~~~~
f.r<rq -.r-mfT t, ~: :-

1 ( I) -4 f.l<l'lp~;q~m~ ~ (~) ('mlT"R) ~, 2011 ~ ~ I

( 2) -4 ~, 20 11 ~ ~ f0 ~ 'ffill m I

2 'CfilhmT ~ ~ (~) ~, 1950 '# ~ ~ ~~ f.p.rq ~ ~ '#~, ~ 58 .q, ~-~ (1) .q,

~ ('fi) if,-

(I) ~-~('&) .q,"~qq"~q;l,"~qq"~~~%m~ I

(2) ~-~ (TT) -G,-
(q;-) "~qtfq;'t ~m 3l~~m(f<fi, ~ \:ft~m"~q;l~~ I

(rg) ~ ~ '#, PI"'1f<:'1f@li1~ q;l ~ ~~, 1Pm: :-

"~T&l~~<m~~~~ ~-v:~:mf3l(f 3l&fl1~~ 3l~ ~:rfi~~
'# 3lTf~ ~ 3la.-1l1i1Tm (fq;' ~ ~ ~ ~ I"

3, '9~~'#,~59-G,"~~m"~q;l"w~m"~1t~~~ I

4. ~~ ~ '#, ~ 61 -G,-
(I) :mn~ ~ '#, "3lf~ <lit ~ ~ q;-8 -v:" ~ q;l,"~ -q,l ~ ~ ~ -V:,?;ff ~fi#Cfi

~qlf1C1f~ ~~ ~ ~qlf1,,!'CIm~?;ff~ ~qIf1,,!f'\1 ffi~"~~~~~;
! 0)4'1 l, I.20I I (I)



2 THE GAZETIE OF INDIA: EXTRAORDINARY [PARTII-SEC. 3(i)]

(2) ~ '< 1 ) ~. "'omtft 3lf~ et ~" ~ et ~"lR" 3l~ ~f""0Cfl (tcuf"11Rt ~ et ~ (t"IA1R1
3l~ ~ \:ft lWR'fT m. ~ (t"lf"1~f~ 11 ~ "Cfll 3fu: ~ ~ ~ I

5.. 1l'Wf ~~, ~ 61 et ~ f"1P1f~f&d ~ 3fu:~ ~~, 1Tl1ff: :-

•• 61 ~ f.qf<$iN11 ~ q;'t 'I:Jl':rnT et ~ 3lIfl3TO l:ffirr- flrnyq;'t 3Wf- mm fq fcflffiI fuoffi'l1q;'t ~ et ~ 3lIfl3TO

l:ffirr-firnT qft ~ W it 3lFf ~ ~ ~ 2 et~ (11) et ~-~ (v) et ~ ~ ~ m
~~~~ml"

[1liT. ~. ~-38012/3/2OJo-m.~.-I]

m -qy~, 3l1R ~

~ : 1l'!:lR~, ~f11tii""l-mrC6T.R.3lT.212, ~ 22~, 1950 mu 'l1mfet ~ et 'WT 11,~ 3,~-~ (j).q
~~~ ttW.fT 3lf~~m.C6T.R. 224, ~ 4~, 2010 muflmffim~ ~~ I

MINISTRY OF LABOUR AND EMPWYMEkr
NOTIFICATION

New Delhi, the 23rd March, 2011
GS.R. 119(E).-Whereas certain draft rules further to amend the Employees' State Insurance (Central) Rules,

1950, were published as required under sub-section (I) of Section 95 of the Employees' State Insurance Act, 1948 (34 of
1948), vide notification of the Government oflndia in the Ministry of Labour and Employment, number G.S.R. 223, dated the
29th November, 2010, in the Gazette of India, dated the 4th December, 2010, inviting objections and suggestions from all
persons likely to be affected thereby till the expiry of the period of thirty days from the date on which the copies of the
Gazette of India in which the said notification was published, were made available to the public;

And whereas, the copies of the said Gazette were made available to the public on 4th December, 2010;
And whereas no objection or suggestion has been received from any person in this regard;
Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by Section 95 of the Employees' State Insurance Act, 1948, the

Central Government, after consultation with the Employees' State Insurance Corporation, hereby makes the following
rules further to amend the Employees' State Insurance (Central) Rules, 1950, namely:-

I. (I) These Rules may be called the Employees' State Insurance (Central) (Amendment) Rules, 2011.
(2) They shall come into force with effect from the Ist day of April, 2011.

2. In the Employees' State Insurance (Central) Rules, 1950 (hereinafter referred to as the principal rules), in rule 58,
in sub-rule (1), in clause (A),-

(i) in sub-clause (b), for the words "eighteen years", the words "twenty-five years" shall be substituted;
(ii) in sub-clause (c),- I

(A) the words "until she attains the age of eighteen years or until marriage, whichever is earlier" shall be
omitted;

(8) for the first proviso, the following proviso shall be substituted, namely :-
"Provided that in the case of legitimate or adopted daughter who is inform and is wholly dependant on
the earnings of the insured person at the time of his death, dependants' benefit shall continue to be
paid while the infirmity lasts.".

3. In the principal rules, in rule 59, for the words "five thousand rupees", the words "ten thousand rupees" shall
be substituted.

4. In the principal rules, in rule 61,-
(i) in the opening portion, for the words "on attaining the age of superannuation", the words "on attaining

the age of superannuation, or retires under a Voluntary Retirement Scheme or takes premature retirement"
shall be substituted;

(ii) in term (i), after the words "proof of his superannuation", the words "or retirement under a Voluntary
Retirement Scheme or as the case may be, premature retirement," shall be inserted.

5. In the principal rules, after rule 61, the following rule shall be inserted, namely :-
"61 A. Income limit of dependent parents for eligibility to medical benefit-The income of dependent parents
for eligibility to medical benefit under sub-clause (v) of clause (11) of Section 2 of the Act from all sources
should not exceed five thousand rupees in a month.".

[F. No. S-3801213120 IO.SS.}]
RAV}MATHUR,Addl. Secy.

Note The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, Part Il, Section 3, Sub-section (i), vide notification
number S.R.O. 212, dated the 22nd June, 1950 and last amended vide notification No. G.S.R. 224, dated
4th December, 20 IO.

- ---------------------------------,------------
Printed by the Manager, Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-I 10064

and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-I 10054.


